
Freedom of Information Request – Council Tax bands 

Date received:28/02/22 

Request and Response: 
 
I I am sending this request under the Freedom of Information Act to ask for the 
following information: 
 
 
1. How many domestic properties in your local authority are in council tax bands E, 
F, G and H? (a breakdown per band would be useful) 
 
E: 7892 
F: 3214 
G: 1168 
H: 30 
 
2. How many domestic properties in your local authority in council tax bands E, F, G 
and H have been purchased on the Shared Ownership scheme up until the date 3 
February 2022? (a breakdown per band would be useful) 
 
This information is not held by the Council. 
 
3. How many domestic properties in your local authority in council tax bands E, F, G 
and H were purchased on the Help To Buy scheme up until the date 3 February 
2022? (a breakdown per band would be useful) 
 
This information is not held by the Council. 

 


